
T TWO CHEMISTS WHOSE
work together advanced the ap
plication of technetium chem

istry to the design ofuseful radiophar
maceuticals are the recipients of the
1993 Paul C. Aebersold Award for Out
standing Achievement in Basic Science
Applied to Nuclear Medicine.

Alun Jones, PhD, associate professor
ofradiology at Harvard Medical School
and Alan Davison, PhD, professor of
chemistry at Massachusetts Institute of
Technology, have worked for more than
a decade on the design and characteriza
tion technetium complexes and share
credit for some of the most important
strides in the annals ofthe science of nu
clear medicine.

â€œTheirresults have been a significant
part of the knowledge that has turned
the compounding oftechnetium agents
from alchemy to chemistry,â€•says S.
James Adelstein, MD, PhD, Paul C.
Cabot Professor of Medical Biophysics
at Harvard Medical School.

â€œIt'squite unique that two people are
receiving the Aebersold Award but I'm
not surprised it's these two,â€•says Jim
Kronauge, PhD, assistant professor of
radiology at Brigham and Women's
Hospital. â€œTheyhave had a unique and
very successful collaboration. Their
work has become so intertwined that
people often refer to Drs. Jones and
Davison as â€˜thetwo Alans.â€•

â€œTheyare both terrific scientists and
very gifted teachers,â€• says Mike

Abrams, PhD, manager of biomedical
research worldwide with Johnson
Matthey, Inc. who did his graduate work
at MIT under Dr. Davison from 1979 to
1983. â€œTheyprovided a terrific environ
ment for doing research and developing

the talents of graduate students.â€•Dr.
Abrams says that seminal experiments
by his former teachers made way for the
development ofnow indispensable @Tc
labeled radiopharmaceuticals like
MAG3 and sestamibi (@Tc-methoxy
isobutyl isonitrile).

Dr. Kronaugesays the two scientists
complement each other, coming from
differentbackgrounds.Dr. Davison is a
coordination chemist whose early work
probing the structure of bio-organic
complexes earned him a professorship at
MIT.The nuclearchemistDr.Jonesen
tered the field of radiopharmaceutical
development shortly after earning his
doctoraldegree and began working on
technetium-labeled bone scanning
agents.

â€œThesechemists have made funda
mental contributions to the science and
practice ofnuclear medicine,â€•says B.
Leonard Holman, MD, chairman of the
department ofradiology and Cook Pro
fessor of Medicine at Brigham and
Women's Hospital. Dr. Holman, who
has worked with both chemists for two
decades, gives equal weight to Davi
son's and Jones's contributions to the
synthesis of technetium-based radio
pharmaceuticals.

â€œDavisonbringsto the partnershipan
amazing knowledge of metalo-chem
istry and a highly creative intellect which
has resulted in truly creative approaches
to our understanding of technetium
chemistry and the application ofthis un
derstandingtopracticalandusefulradio
pharmaceuticals.â€•he says. â€œJoneshas
been equally creative in shaping the na
ture of the basic investigations to pro
duce structures which have had enor
mous functional utility in cardiac,

oncologic and renal physiology.â€•
The developmentofthe isonitrile fam

ily, Dr. Holman says, led to the â€œsingle
most exciting radiopharmaceuticalâ€•for
the evaluation ofmyocardial perfusion
(sestamibi). â€œThisagent may well have
additional applications as a biochemical
probeallowingus to lookatmitochondr
ial membrane viability,â€•he says.

Both chemists are natives of the
United Kingdom. Dr. Davison was born
in Ealing, England and Dr. Jones hails
from Rhyl, Clwyd, Wales. Dr. Davison
received his PhD and DIC in chemistry
from ImperialCollege of Science and
Technology, in 1962.His first academic
appointment was in 1962 at Harvard
wherehe was a chemistryinstructor.In
1964, he went to MIT where he served
as an assistant and associate professor of
chemistry before becoming a full pro
fessorin 1974.

From 1967 to 1969, Dr. Jones was a
research associate at the Institute for
Nuclear Physics Research in Amster
dam. He served as an associate and prim

cipal associate in radiology at Harvard
Medical School from 1971 to 1979 be
fore becoming an assistant professor in
1979. Dr. Jones became associate pro
fessor ofradiology in 1982.

The Society of Nuclear Medicine
honors with the Paul C. Aebersold
Award the researcher or, as in this
year's case, researchers who demon
strate outstanding achievement in basic
science applied to nuclear medicine.
This award is named in honor of Dr.
Paul Clarence Aebersold who con
tributed greatly to the application of nu
clear physics to medicine and biology.
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